
[[136502]] VOLVO A40G 752154 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP450624
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 136502

LATTIMORE MATERIALS/HOLCIM - ROSSER - LAFARGE14242 S SH-34SCURRY, TXUS  75158Contact: WALLACE WARRENwallace.warren@lafargeholcim.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: LATSCUUnique No: 11075566Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Jun 2024
Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 06208105 (Generated: 06/14/2024 00:36:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450624 VCP442500 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2024 03 Apr 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 880 530 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.5 52.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 4 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 250 209 --- ---Copper ppm 2 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 9 9 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 14 14 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 113 155 --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 52 57 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2473 2402 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 339 272 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 06208105 (Generated: 06/14/2024 00:36:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 752154\Front Axle [VCP450624] 07 Jun 2024 @ 880.0 hrs

