
[[7107HR]] VOLVO L180H 5398 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP449174
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 7107HR

PENNSY SUPPLY INC1001 PAXTON STREETHARRISBURG, PAUS  17111Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (717)233-4511F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. (transmission issues).Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: PENHARUSUnique No: 11075761Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jun 2024
Report Id: PENHARUS [WUSCAR] 06208300 (Generated: 06/14/2024 19:21:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - PENHARUS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449174 VCP335934 --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2024 22 Feb 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 8136 2291 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.4 26.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 3 7 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 70 --- ---Copper ppm 4 9 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 70 94 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 12 12 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 201 162 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 81 59 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PENHARUS [WUSCAR] 06208300 (Generated: 06/14/2024 19:21:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - PENHARUS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5398\Transmission (Auto) [VCP449174] 07 Jun 2024 @ 8136.0 hrs

