
DOOSAN XHP750 412632 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP437468
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No:

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT12345 MAPLEVIEW STREETLAKESIDE, CAUS  92040Contact: Mark Stewartmark.stewart@vcesvolvo.comT:  X:F:  X:
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO4488Unique No: 11076591Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4488 [WUSCAR] 06209130 (Generated: 06/22/2024 06:20:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark Stewart - VOLVO4488

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437468 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 9.21 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 1200 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 48.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -31 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4488 [WUSCAR] 06209130 (Generated: 06/22/2024 06:21:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark Stewart - VOLVO4488
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN XHP750 412632\Coolant [VCP437468] 01 May 2024 @ 2.0 hrs

