
VOLVO EC145EL 314052 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP439804
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. We advise that youcheck for the source of the coolantleak. Check for low coolant level. Oiland filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Test for glycolis positive. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 11077111Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jun 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06209650 (Generated: 06/17/2024 14:00:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439804 VCP408283 VCP359401 VCP344385Sample Date 08 Jun 2024 01 Jun 2023 03 May 2022 29 Oct 2021Machine Hours 3995 2501 1470 1001Oil Hours 0 0 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 12.8 13.2 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 11.0 11.0 12.1 ---Oxidation (PA) % 87 85 87 76
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.5 0.4 0.4Nitration (PA) % 87 70 72 66Sulfation (PA) % 72 63 65 60Glycol % 0.12 NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 26 7 8 11Sodium ppm 761 3 3 3Potassium ppm 1165 0 4 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 38 17 28 71Copper ppm 22 2 2 4Lead ppm 4 0 2 1Tin ppm 6 <1 1 2Aluminum ppm 7 6 7 12Chromium ppm 3 <1 2 3Molybdenum ppm 116 43 37 49Nickel ppm <1 <1 1 2Titanium ppm <1 0 7 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1820 1663 1818 1635Magnesium ppm 413 517 527 638Zinc ppm 1131 1085 1104 1195Phosphorus ppm 1116 890 945 997Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 48 35 48 27

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06209650 (Generated: 06/17/2024 14:00:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC145EL 314052\Diesel Engine [VCP439804] 08 Jun 2024 @ 3995.0 hrs

