
VOLVO L60H 622532 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP439882
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

RECYCLE AMERICA12100 YOUNG PINE RDORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: RECORLUnique No: 11083523Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 18 Jun 2024
Report Id: RECORL [WUSCAR] 06210659 (Generated: 06/22/2024 03:41:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - RECORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439882 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11558 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.04 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 52.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -40 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RECORL [WUSCAR] 06210659 (Generated: 06/22/2024 03:41:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER ? - RECORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622532\Coolant [VCP439882] 10 Jun 2024 @ 11558.0 hrs

