
[[139179 DOLESE]] VOLVO EC220D 210447 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413733
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 139179 DOLESE

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO1876 NORTH 105TH EAST AVENUETULSA, OKUS  74116Contact: MIKE DEVOREMDEVORE@VANKEPPEL.COMT: (918)836-8851F: (918)834-1659
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0053Unique No: 11084091Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06211227 (Generated: 06/21/2024 21:29:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413733 VCP171667 VCP165948 ---Sample Date 14 Jun 2024 10 Feb 2015 15 Jul 2014 ---Machine Hours 7249 1650 1025 ---Oil Hours 0 461 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 14.18 13.85 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 56 56 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.3 0.3 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 68 67 50 ---Sulfation (PA) % 55 50 47 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 10 12 9 ---Sodium ppm 2 4 2 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 77 83 15 ---Copper ppm 2 7 3 ---Lead ppm 0 1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 2 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 6 24 5 ---Chromium ppm <1 7 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 58 45 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 2 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2070 1415 2317 ---Magnesium ppm 498 814 12 ---Zinc ppm 1493 1136 1056 ---Phosphorus ppm 1258 877 932 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 81 33 1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06211227 (Generated: 06/21/2024 21:29:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220D 210447\Diesel Engine [VCP413733] 14 Jun 2024 @ 7249.0 hrs

