
VOLVO L180H 5290 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP444788
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILFLUID 424
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 11085026Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Jun 2024
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06212162 (Generated: 06/21/2024 21:27:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444788 VCP433657 VCP331585 VCP312684Sample Date 04 Jun 2024 06 Mar 2024 13 Nov 2023 07 Sep 2023Machine Hours 7436 6999 6425 5994Oil Hours 1011 574 961 530Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.1 50.9 50.6 51.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG 0.226 NEGSilicon ppm 53 16 19 18Sodium ppm <1 1 5 2Potassium ppm 4 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 37 11 27 21Copper ppm <1 0 0 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 6 <1 <1 3Chromium ppm 1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 0 <1 1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3486 3960 3414 3474Magnesium ppm 19 2 21 20Zinc ppm 1407 1571 1435 1465Phosphorus ppm 1193 1254 1136 1150Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 119 130 117 136

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06212162 (Generated: 06/21/2024 21:27:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5290\Front Axle [VCP444788] 04 Jun 2024 @ 7436.0 hrs

