
[[717377 RENTALS]] YANMAR V1080-7 70628 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP439827
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 717377 RENTALS

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: N. FACEYnfacey@altaequipfl.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. Oil andfilter change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Fuelcontent negligible. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 11087193Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 21 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06214329 (Generated: 06/23/2024 03:27:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439827 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 459 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 47 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.8 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 40 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 172 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 --- --- ---Copper ppm 174 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 151 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2207 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 716 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 622 --- --- ---Barium ppm 5 --- --- ---Boron ppm 152 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06214329 (Generated: 06/23/2024 03:27:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	YANMAR YANMAR V1080-7 70628\Diesel Engine [VCP439827] 12 Jun 2024 @ 459.0 hrs

