
VOLVO L120H 633087 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP434907
Oil Type: BP AW 46
Job No:

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 11087442Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 20 Jun 2024
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06214578 (Generated: 06/21/2024 12:39:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434907 VCP383146 VCP393381 VCP384132Sample Date 14 Jun 2024 16 Sep 2023 19 May 2023 12 Jan 2023Machine Hours 2940 1985 1500 985Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.5 41.7 43.1 43.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.38 0.40 0.28 0.31
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 7296 2095 6707 1781Particles >6µm 2232 494 1285 203Particles >14µm 87 34 86 18ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/14 18/16/12 20/17/14 18/15/11Silicon ppm 4 1 3 2Sodium ppm 0 <1 2 1Potassium ppm 2 0 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 4 5 4Copper ppm 2 35 <1 1Lead ppm <1 0 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 0 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 3 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 52 35 65 60Magnesium ppm 4 0 13 2Zinc ppm 437 361 470 438Phosphorus ppm 325 376 377 328Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06214578 (Generated: 06/21/2024 12:39:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633087\Hydraulic System [VCP434907] 14 Jun 2024 @ 2940.0 hrs

