
[[A12797]] VOLVO L110H 632014 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP445218
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A12797

HMR ASSOCIATESPO BOX 485TOUGHKENAMON, PAUS  19374Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: F: (610)268-2225
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: HMRTOUUnique No: 11088266Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Jun 2024
Report Id: HMRTOU [WUSCAR] 06215402 (Generated: 06/21/2024 10:36:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - HMRTOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445218 VCP432252 VCP404050 VCP400359Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 19 Dec 2023 04 Apr 2023 17 Jan 2023Machine Hours 7800 7370 6860 6180Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 13.4 13.2 13.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.4 6.4 7.7 8.8Oxidation (PA) % 44 49 49 58
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 65 63 71 63Sulfation (PA) % 50 52 50 52Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 4 3 3Sodium ppm 3 2 2 2Potassium ppm 7 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 12 8 9Copper ppm 2 2 <1 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 1Aluminum ppm 7 8 3 5Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 7 14 31 49Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2370 2095 1711 1436Magnesium ppm 105 167 424 716Zinc ppm 1176 1117 1092 1212Phosphorus ppm 986 926 913 999Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 7 4 5 8

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HMRTOU [WUSCAR] 06215402 (Generated: 06/21/2024 10:36:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - HMRTOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632014\Diesel Engine [VCP445218] 05 Jun 2024 @ 7800.0 hrs

