
[[717204 RUBY RECYCLIN]] KOMATSU WA270 81496 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP452668
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 717204 RUBY RECYCLIN

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 11088269Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06215405 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:56:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452668 VCP431410 VCP402847 ---Sample Date 11 Jun 2024 26 Sep 2023 24 Mar 2023 ---Machine Hours 6274 4491 3262 ---Oil Hours 500 500 1800 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.7 12.4 13.6 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 8.9 3.8 ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 67 119 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.1 0.5 0.6 ---Nitration (PA) % 42 76 120 ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 54 84 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 0.8 5.6 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 5 4 9 ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 ---Potassium ppm 4 0 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 12 65 ---Copper ppm 0 3 20 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 5 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 56 59 64 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1766 1014 1714 ---Magnesium ppm 452 948 462 ---Zinc ppm 1326 1222 1229 ---Phosphorus ppm 1134 964 990 ---Barium ppm 0 0 2 ---Boron ppm 124 0 29 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06215405 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:57:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU KOMATSU WA270 81496\Diesel Engine [VCP452668] 11 Jun 2024 @ 6274.0 hrs

