
[[3764 SAGE GREEN]] VOLVO A45G 353243 - FILTER - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP455414
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 3764 SAGE GREEN

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. (FAILURE).All componentwear rates are normal. The wearmetal levels do not reflect thereported failure. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the fluid. The condition ofthe fluid is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 11089080Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06216216 (Generated: 06/23/2024 13:46:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455414 VCP446812 --- ---Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 30 May 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 1264 1243 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.2 28.1 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 18 21 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 6 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 44 40 --- ---Copper ppm 23 22 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 3 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 18 18 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 63 77 --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 7 6 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 220 214 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 77 92 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06216216 (Generated: 06/23/2024 13:46:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353243 - FILTER\Transmission (Auto) [VCP455414] 17 Jun 2024 @ 1264.0 hrs

