
[[25899]] VOLVO SD75 624698 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP453719
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 25899

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 11089402Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06216538 (Generated: 06/25/2024 15:17:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453719 VCP423577 --- ---Sample Date 14 Jun 2024 12 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1014 593 --- ---Oil Hours 0 500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.0 12.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.3 8.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 71 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.3 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 53 55 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 54 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 2.1 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 14 19 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 32 --- ---Copper ppm 3 9 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 11 20 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 25 38 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 5 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2356 1536 --- ---Magnesium ppm 344 584 --- ---Zinc ppm 1213 1143 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 962 961 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 63 45 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06216538 (Generated: 06/25/2024 15:17:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD75 624698\Diesel Engine [VCP453719] 14 Jun 2024 @ 1014.0 hrs

