
VOLVO L220H 3440 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP453824
Oil Type: PENNZOIL DEXRON MERCON ATF FLUID
Job No:

COVANTA ENERGY141 CRANBERRY HWYWEST WAREHAM, MAUS  02576Contact: SAWYERssawyer@woodcomachinery.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COVWESUnique No: 11090091Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Jun 2024
Report Id: COVWES [WUSCAR] 06217227 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:12:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? SAWYER - COVWES

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453824 VCP440712 VCP440505 VCP432421Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 19 Apr 2024 07 Mar 2024 27 Jan 2024Machine Hours 10140 9009 8197 7338Oil Hours 1131 812 859 860Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 25.4 28.4 22.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 2 3 2Sodium ppm 4 <1 <1 1Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 41 27 31 33Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 2 0Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 93 91 98 21Magnesium ppm 0 2 2 0Zinc ppm 5 2 5 0Phosphorus ppm 254 246 251 239Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 108 118 116 139

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COVWES [WUSCAR] 06217227 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:12:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? SAWYER - COVWES
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3440\Transmission (Auto) [VCP453824] 17 Jun 2024 @ 10140.0 hrs

