
[[226138 PIRTTN]] VOLVO L70H 623615 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP441364
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: 226138 PIRTTN

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 11090092Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06217228 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:12:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441364 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4225 --- --- ---Oil Hours 4225 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 112 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 42 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 196 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 57 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06217228 (Generated: 06/24/2024 15:12:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623615\Transmission (Auto) [VCP441364] 11 Jun 2024 @ 4225.0 hrs

