
VOLVO A45GFS 352524 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP395690
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No:

DUNN CONSTRUCTION INC318 N 14TH STBELLEVUE, IAUS  52031Contact: STEVE DUNNDUNNCONSTRUCTINC@GMAIL.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DUNBELUnique No: 11097127Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Jun 2024
Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 06218930 (Generated: 06/25/2024 14:51:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP395690 VCP399776 VCP382708 VCP423361Sample Date 14 May 2024 27 Feb 2024 21 Nov 2023 18 Sep 2023Machine Hours 4634 4351 4090 3390Oil Hours 0 0 100 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 110 109 108 107
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 28 32 24 22Sodium ppm 3 3 3 2Potassium ppm 2 2 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 126 150 109 111Copper ppm 5 8 4 4Lead ppm <1 <1 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 2 1 2Chromium ppm 2 3 2 2Molybdenum ppm 8 10 7 8Nickel ppm 1 1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 3 2 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 125 26 30Magnesium ppm 2 3 2 2Zinc ppm 39 70 16 30Phosphorus ppm 1376 1304 1280 1290Barium ppm 1 0 0 <1Boron ppm 61 81 68 71

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 06218930 (Generated: 06/25/2024 14:51:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45GFS 352524\Drop Box [VCP395690] 14 May 2024 @ 4634.0 hrs

