
[[X49170]] TADANO GR550XL-3 542111 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP408347
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X49170

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: A CLARKACLARK@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 11098950Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06220753 (Generated: 06/28/2024 09:01:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: A CLARK - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408347 VCP389055 --- ---Sample Date 21 Jun 2024 22 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 3587 1166 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 13.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 5.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 86 77 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.1 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 72 83 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 62 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 2.9 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 12 43 --- ---Sodium ppm 4 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 6 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 44 --- ---Copper ppm 3 147 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 8 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 38 58 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1616 1784 --- ---Magnesium ppm 477 382 --- ---Zinc ppm 1112 1222 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 864 906 --- ---Barium ppm 0 3 --- ---Boron ppm 33 51 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06220753 (Generated: 06/28/2024 09:01:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: A CLARK - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TADANO TADANO GR550XL-3 542111\Diesel Engine [VCP408347] 21 Jun 2024 @ 3587.0 hrs

