
VOLVO L90H 623478 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP416266
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 SDE SAE 15W40
Job No:

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - DONNA900 N HUTTO RDDONNA, TXUS  78537Contact: DOLLY SANDOVALYSANDOVAL@IAAI.COMT: (404)275-6868F: (404)366-1011
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: INSDONUnique No: 11098960Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 27 Jun 2024
Report Id: INSDON [WUSCAR] 06220763 (Generated: 06/27/2024 14:40:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DOLLY SANDOVAL - INSDON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416266 VCP258375 VCP229003 VCP228654Sample Date 12 Jun 2024 14 Jan 2020 12 Aug 2019 18 Dec 2018Machine Hours 6274 3499 3003 2508Oil Hours 0 1000 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 13.9 13.4 13.52Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 55 67 67 67
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.3 0.3 0.4Nitration (PA) % 53 67 67 68Sulfation (PA) % 54 59 58 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 7 8Sodium ppm 1 2 3 2Potassium ppm 2 0 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 8 9 15Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 6 10 11 16Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 94 96 123 123Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1406 1566 1440 1431Magnesium ppm 469 496 536 551Zinc ppm 1185 1006 800 825Phosphorus ppm 904 811 686 728Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 354 284 253 204

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSDON [WUSCAR] 06220763 (Generated: 06/27/2024 14:40:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DOLLY SANDOVAL - INSDON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623478\Diesel Engine [VCP416266] 12 Jun 2024 @ 6274.0 hrs

