
632616 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442295
Oil Type: SHELL Rotella T5 15W-40
Job No:

DUNNING INDUSTRIES105 BRICKYARD RDFARMINGTON, CTUS  06032Contact: Service ManagerMECHANIC@DUNNINGINDUSTRIES.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DUNFARUnique No: 11098964Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 27 Jun 2024
Report Id: DUNFAR [WUSCAR] 06220767 (Generated: 06/27/2024 15:19:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DUNFAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442295 VCP437115 VCP443061 VCP434063Sample Date 15 Jun 2024 09 Apr 2024 15 Feb 2024 07 Dec 2023Machine Hours 6821 6506 6331 6218Oil Hours 300 250 106 1Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd N/ASample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.5 11.9 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.3 9.0 7.4 9.9Oxidation (PA) % 52 75 60 69
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 59 49 53 46Sulfation (PA) % 49 59 55 56Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 0.3 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 33 25 8Sodium ppm 3 9 9 4Potassium ppm 4 13 7 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 11 6 6Copper ppm 2 11 5 <1Lead ppm 0 1 0 0Tin ppm 1 4 2 0Aluminum ppm 3 4 3 6Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 54 40 33 51Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1839 1695 1536 1603Magnesium ppm 127 431 376 446Zinc ppm 1086 1077 905 1132Phosphorus ppm 862 948 832 946Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 54 59 53 63

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNFAR [WUSCAR] 06220767 (Generated: 06/27/2024 15:19:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - DUNFAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 632616\Diesel Engine [VCP442295] 15 Jun 2024 @ 6821.0 hrs

