
[[SW-35465-2 TEARAPART]] VOLVO EC160 310236 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP454027
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SW-35465-2 TEARAPART

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Appearance is hazy. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 11099339Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06221142 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:46:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454027 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3935 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3935 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.36 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.135 --- --- ---Particles >4µm 1079 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 588 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 100 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 17/16/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 23 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 428 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 350 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06221142 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:46:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160 310236\Hydraulic System [VCP454027] 17 Jun 2024 @ 3935.0 hrs

