
VOLVO L120H 633400 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP443997
Oil Type: VALVOLINE 15W40
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 11099800Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06221603 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:27:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443997 VCP439000 VCP437225 VCP442182Sample Date 13 Jun 2024 02 Apr 2024 20 Feb 2024 19 Oct 2023Machine Hours 3134 0 2033 1010Oil Hours 0 0 0 1010Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.7 43.0 43.5 41.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 18 19 20 31Sodium ppm 2 1 2 4Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 68 60 100 156Copper ppm <1 <1 0 1Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 1 <1 2 4Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 3 8Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 4 8Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3830 4105 3593 3649Magnesium ppm 16 17 15 23Zinc ppm 1509 1689 1411 1548Phosphorus ppm 1217 1433 1180 1276Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 119 155 124 133

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06221603 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:27:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633400\Front Axle [VCP443997] 13 Jun 2024 @ 3134.0 hrs

