
VOLVO L120H 633400 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP443999
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 11099801Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06221604 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:27:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443999 VCP438893 VCP437226 VCP442188Sample Date 13 Jun 2024 12 Apr 2024 20 Feb 2024 19 Oct 2023Machine Hours 3134 0 2033 1010Oil Hours 0 0 0 1010Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 43.1 42.9 43.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 18 18 17 23Sodium ppm 2 1 3 4Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 82 69 158 273Copper ppm <1 0 0 1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 1Chromium ppm 1 <1 2 4Molybdenum ppm 2 2 5 7Nickel ppm 0 0 0 1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 3 6 10Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3885 4247 3610 3615Magnesium ppm 17 19 16 22Zinc ppm 1540 1706 1422 1533Phosphorus ppm 1208 1406 1194 1283Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 121 149 123 131

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06221604 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:27:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633400\Rear Axle [VCP443999] 13 Jun 2024 @ 3134.0 hrs

