
[[587695]] VOLVO L70H 623953 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP439542
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 587695

OLDCASTLE LAWN AND GARDEN2427 RWS RANCH RDDAVENPORT, FLUS  33837Contact: DAVID ORTIZdavid.ortiz@oldcastle.comT: (800)833-2984F: (863)421-1776
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: GREDAVFLUnique No: 11099805Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 27 Jun 2024
Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221608 (Generated: 06/27/2024 15:33:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439542 VCP357844 --- ---Sample Date 18 Jun 2024 27 Apr 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 7398 2062 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.7 40.7 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 20 16 --- ---Sodium ppm 6 12 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 277 244 --- ---Copper ppm 107 25 --- ---Lead ppm 2 1 --- ---Tin ppm 12 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 7 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 5 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 3 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 13 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3938 4076 --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1519 1591 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1244 1377 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 121 125 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221608 (Generated: 06/27/2024 15:33:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623953\Rear Axle [VCP439542] 18 Jun 2024 @ 7398.0 hrs

