
[[587695]] VOLVO L70H 623953 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP439826
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: 587695

OLDCASTLE LAWN AND GARDEN2427 RWS RANCH RDDAVENPORT, FLUS  33837Contact: DAVID ORTIZdavid.ortiz@oldcastle.comT: (800)833-2984F: (863)421-1776
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Copper and tin ppm levelsare abnormal. Bearing and/orbushing wear is indicated. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: GREDAVFLUnique No: 11099807Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221610 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:31:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439826 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7398 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.323 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 278 --- --- ---Copper ppm 106 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 12 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3939 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 27 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1522 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1229 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 119 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221610 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:31:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623953\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP439826] 18 Jun 2024 @ 7398.0 hrs

