
[[587695]] VOLVO L70H 623953 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440201
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: 587695

OLDCASTLE LAWN AND GARDEN2427 RWS RANCH RDDAVENPORT, FLUS  33837Contact: DAVID ORTIZdavid.ortiz@oldcastle.comT: (800)833-2984F: (863)421-1776
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Bearing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: GREDAVFLUnique No: 11099812Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221615 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:31:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440201 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7398 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 28 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 320 --- --- ---Copper ppm 108 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 12 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3923 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 16 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1497 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1243 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 121 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06221615 (Generated: 06/29/2024 01:31:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623953\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP440201] 18 Jun 2024 @ 7398.0 hrs

