
[[SW-35465-2 TEARAPART]] VOLVO EC160 310236 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454196
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-35465-2 TEARAPART

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 11099825Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06221628 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:46:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454196 VCP254020 VCP242974 VCP218022Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 05 Oct 2020 13 Mar 2019 12 Oct 2017Machine Hours 3935 2939 2112 532Oil Hours 0 0 0 532Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ChangedSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 264.3 101 127.0 182.8
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 5 9 23 28Sodium ppm 2 1 1 2Potassium ppm 7 3 0 11
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 329 605 466 426Copper ppm 11 14 8 19Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 0 2 1Chromium ppm 4 6 6 7Molybdenum ppm <1 1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 4 6 5 8Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 16 60 24 2Magnesium ppm <1 10 10 <1Zinc ppm 83 214 88 20Phosphorus ppm 943 803 837 422Barium ppm 0 0 <1 3Boron ppm 96 93 100 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06221628 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:46:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160 310236\Swing Drive [VCP454196] 17 Jun 2024 @ 3935.0 hrs

