
[[G08834 BCI-BLACKWOOD]] VOLVO A40D 12347 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP445280
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: G08834 BCI-BLACKWOOD

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - DEPTFORD1330 HURFFVILLE ROADDEPTFORD, NJUS  08096Contact: TAMMY SANDORAtammy.sandora@hoffmanequip.comT: (856)227-6400F: (856)227-0046
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8880Unique No: 11100125Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 01 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8880 [WUSCAR] 06221928 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:47:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMMY SANDORA - VOLVO8880

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445280 VCP32707 --- ---Sample Date 24 Jun 2024 03 May 2006 --- ---Machine Hours 15592 838 --- ---Oil Hours 0 250 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.5 12.7 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 43 65 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.5 0.4 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 61 25 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 37 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 2.7 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 4 --- ---Sodium ppm 1 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 19 --- ---Copper ppm <1 2 --- ---Lead ppm 2 1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 11 9 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 1 --- ---Titanium ppm 3 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2422 2579 --- ---Magnesium ppm 171 123 --- ---Zinc ppm 1132 1174 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 999 1058 --- ---Barium ppm 0 7 --- ---Boron ppm 15 20 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8880 [WUSCAR] 06221928 (Generated: 07/02/2024 01:47:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMMY SANDORA - VOLVO8880
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 12347\Diesel Engine [VCP445280] 24 Jun 2024 @ 15592.0 hrs

