
[[12835 SIGNAL MTN]]  - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP384975
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 12835 SIGNAL MTN

536 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CHATTANOOGA7829 LEE HWYCHATTANOOGA, TNUS  37421Contact: WILLIAM WALKERwilliam.walker@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (423)308-7959
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0117Unique No: 11100172Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06221975 (Generated: 07/01/2024 09:33:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384975 ASC0006019 VCP370714 VCP332404Sample Date 17 May 2024 18 Jan 2024 15 Feb 2023 10 Aug 2022Machine Hours 5505 4667 2584 1471Oil Hours 0 0 0 1471Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 13.0 13.0 13.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.4 8.9 9.2 11.8Oxidation (PA) % 78 86 84 87
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 50 72 72 66Sulfation (PA) % 60 62 63 67Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.6 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 6 5 4Sodium ppm 5 2 2 3Potassium ppm 3 1 4 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 8 9 6Copper ppm <1 1 4 6Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 39 38 42 50Nickel ppm <1 0 0 1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1695 1648 1701 1778Magnesium ppm 519 468 496 524Zinc ppm 1165 996 1105 1206Phosphorus ppm 949 853 911 990Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 58 33 39 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06221975 (Generated: 07/01/2024 09:34:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO \Diesel Engine [VCP384975] 17 May 2024 @ 5505.0 hrs

