
VOLVO A25F 80223 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP442476
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30
Job No:

536 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CHATTANOOGA7829 LEE HWYCHATTANOOGA, TNUS  37421Contact: WILLIAM WALKERwilliam.walker@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (423)308-7959
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0117Unique No: 11100173Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 27 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06221976 (Generated: 06/27/2024 18:08:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442476 VCE158037 VCE211264 ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2024 30 Jan 2015 15 Oct 2014 ---Machine Hours 7415 1750 1120 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.64 12.81 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 82 60 44 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 63 67 50 ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 53 50 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 6 10 15 ---Sodium ppm 5 7 6 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 19 17 ---Copper ppm <1 61 118 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 3 ---Aluminum ppm 5 3 2 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 41 46 56 ---Nickel ppm <1 2 2 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1720 1316 1407 ---Magnesium ppm 545 809 814 ---Zinc ppm 1204 1064 1008 ---Phosphorus ppm 974 796 845 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 44 7 13 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0117 [WUSCAR] 06221976 (Generated: 06/27/2024 18:08:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILLIAM WALKER - VOLVO0117
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25F 80223\Diesel Engine [VCP442476] 26 Jun 2024 @ 7415.0 hrs

