
[[X18706]] VOLVO A40G 353135 - TANK WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP433021
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: X18706

APAC BENTON393 OREILLY RDBENTON, MSUS  39039Contact: WILL RATLIFFwill.ratliffjr@apac.comT: (601)397-3696F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: APABENUnique No: 11100801Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Jun 2024
Report Id: APABEN [WUSCAR] 06222604 (Generated: 06/29/2024 11:26:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL RATLIFF - APABEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433021 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4110 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 49 --- --- ---Copper ppm 56 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3468 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1536 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1417 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 122 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: APABEN [WUSCAR] 06222604 (Generated: 06/29/2024 11:26:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL RATLIFF - APABEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353135\Tank Wet Disc Brake [VCP433021] 17 Jun 2024 @ 4110.0 hrs

