
VOLVO A45G 352344 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP0008178
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 11100862Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 02 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06222665 (Generated: 07/02/2024 22:14:38) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008178 VCP402824 VCP350603 ---Sample Date 19 Jun 2024 23 Jun 2023 04 Jan 2022 ---Machine Hours 0 4120 2007 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 363.5 195 195 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 4 4 4 ---Sodium ppm <1 1 0 ---Potassium ppm <1 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 190 187 ---Copper ppm <1 3 2 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 3 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 3 3 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 7 6 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 9 7 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4 215 200 ---Magnesium ppm <1 51 49 ---Zinc ppm 5 139 127 ---Phosphorus ppm 1016 1037 977 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 182 174 188 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06222665 (Generated: 07/02/2024 22:14:39) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352344\Rear Axle [VCP0008178] 19 Jun 2024 @ .0 hrs

