
[[A12896 IAA]] VOLVO L90H 626688 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP449563
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A12896 IAA

HOFFMAN EQUIPMENT - LIONVILLE120 GORDON DRIVELIONVILLE, PAUS  19341Contact: JIM FEHRjim.fehr@hoffmanequip.comT: (610)363-9200F: (610)594-0829
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8879Unique No: 11101290Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 06223093 (Generated: 06/28/2024 16:54:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449563 VCP440349 VCP412825 ---Sample Date 19 Jun 2024 23 Feb 2024 20 Sep 2023 ---Machine Hours 1645 1155 660 ---Oil Hours 500 500 660 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 12.4 12.7 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.7 6.3 8.9 ---Oxidation (PA) % 51 47 76 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.4 0.3 0.6 ---Nitration (PA) % 71 62 68 ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 49 59 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 0.6 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 7 7 26 ---Sodium ppm 1 2 9 ---Potassium ppm 2 2 5 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 20 48 ---Copper ppm 2 3 13 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 2 ---Tin ppm 2 2 5 ---Aluminum ppm 5 6 27 ---Chromium ppm 2 2 5 ---Molybdenum ppm 10 23 49 ---Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 23 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 2 8 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2239 1624 1776 ---Magnesium ppm 201 264 712 ---Zinc ppm 1184 975 1318 ---Phosphorus ppm 971 790 1095 ---Barium ppm 1 2 4 ---Boron ppm 21 10 48 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8879 [WUSCAR] 06223093 (Generated: 06/28/2024 16:55:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM FEHR - VOLVO8879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626688\Diesel Engine [VCP449563] 19 Jun 2024 @ 1645.0 hrs

