
[[N11907 CON ED]] CASE 590SN NNC782727 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP320281
Oil Type: CNH IND TRANS AXLE 80W140
Job No: N11907 CON ED

Hoffman Equipment - Bronx1144 Zerega AvenueBronx, NYUS  10462Contact: PATRICK STROHpatrick.stroh@hoffmanequip.comT: (718)822-1180F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HOFBROUnique No: 11103047Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 02 Jul 2024
Report Id: HOFBRO [WUSCAR] 06224850 (Generated: 07/02/2024 13:32:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PATRICK STROH - HOFBRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP320281 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 272 --- --- ---Oil Hours 272 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 183 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 63 --- --- ---Copper ppm 37 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3616 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1276 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1085 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 8 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOFBRO [WUSCAR] 06224850 (Generated: 07/02/2024 13:32:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PATRICK STROH - HOFBRO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CASE CASE 590SN NNC782727\Front Axle [VCP320281] 28 Jun 2024 @ 272.0 hrs

