
[[SWA590217-20]] VOLVO A30G 752316 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP447050
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWA590217-20

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: N. FACEYnfacey@altaequipfl.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. We recommend thatyou drain the oil from the componentif this has not already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. There isa high concentration of water presentin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 11110071Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 05 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06226578 (Generated: 07/09/2024 16:24:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447050 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3960 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 58.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.83 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 73 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 12 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 512 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 24 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 106 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 12 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 381 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1602 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 91 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06226578 (Generated: 07/09/2024 16:24:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752316\Drop Box [VCP447050] 20 Jun 2024 @ 3960.0 hrs

