
[[2492]]  - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP455225
Oil Type: MOBIL 75W90
Job No: 2492

SIMS METAL130 NORTH 12TH STSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95814Contact: EVERT
T: (916)769-7864F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We advise that you inspect forthe source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: SIMSACCAUnique No: 11111380Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2024
Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06227887 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:26:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455225 VCP293614 --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2024 23 Dec 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 8260 2437 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 178 210 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 6.12 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 25 2 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2024 111 --- ---Copper ppm 229 38 --- ---Lead ppm 2 0 --- ---Tin ppm 40 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 16 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 1 --- ---Nickel ppm 5 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 15 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 36 3 --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 242 30 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1028 348 --- ---Barium ppm <1 1 --- ---Boron ppm 131 16 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06227887 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:26:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN \Left Swing Drive [VCP455225] 28 Jun 2024 @ 8260.0 hrs

