
[[2492]]  - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP455230
Oil Type: MOBIL 75W90
Job No: 2492

SIMS METAL130 NORTH 12TH STSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95814Contact: EVERT
T: (916)769-7864F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Bearing and/or bushing wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SIMSACCAUnique No: 11111382Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2024
Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06227889 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:26:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455230 VCP293613 --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2024 23 Dec 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 8260 2437 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 135 206 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 12 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1474 807 --- ---Copper ppm 296 65 --- ---Lead ppm 1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 17 5 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 10 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 12 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 24 5 --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 3 --- ---Zinc ppm 110 108 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1003 339 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 122 13 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06227889 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:26:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN \Right Swing Drive [VCP455230] 28 Jun 2024 @ 8260.0 hrs

