
PETERBILT 337 EM215565 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP446682
Oil Type: MOBIL 75W90
Job No:

SILVERPOINT ENTERPRISES637N 2743EROBERTS, IDUS  83444Contact: BRADLEY HAHNsilverpointenterprises20@gmail.comT: (208)270-1141F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SILROBIDUnique No: 11111383Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2024
Report Id: SILROBID [WUSCAR] 06227890 (Generated: 07/08/2024 13:32:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADLEY HAHN - SILROBID

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446682 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 18000 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 100 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 70 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 514 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 11 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 61 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 18 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 807 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 89 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SILROBID [WUSCAR] 06227890 (Generated: 07/08/2024 13:32:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADLEY HAHN - SILROBID
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PETERBILT PETERBILT 337 EM215565\Rear Axle [VCP446682] 01 Jul 2024 @ 18000.0 hrs

