
VOLVO L220ELR 314360 - RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP0008477
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Component wear metallevel(s) high for break in. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 11111455Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 07 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06227962 (Generated: 07/08/2024 16:06:56) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008477 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1360 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1360 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 304 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 781 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 33 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2580 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 121 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 26 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 13 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 10 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 28 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 239 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 21 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 894 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06227962 (Generated: 07/08/2024 16:06:57) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220ELR 314360\Right Final Drive [VCP0008477] 27 Jun 2024 @ 1360.0 hrs

