
VOLVO A45G 342727 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP0008465
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We recommend that you perform apartial drain and top off with straightantifreeze to increase level of glycol.There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is lower than acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 11111534Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06228041 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:20:11) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008465 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3922 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.76 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 33.7 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C 0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06228041 (Generated: 07/09/2024 12:20:14) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342727\Coolant [VCP0008465] 27 Jun 2024 @ 3922.0 hrs

