
[[48882]] KOBELCO SK210 YN17010800 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP454681
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: 48882

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: HARRY HOGANHHOGAN@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: (615)793-3888F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou perform a filter service, and useoff-line filtration to improve thecleanliness of the system fluid. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. There is toomuch water present in this sample toperform a particle count.Metal levelsare typical for a new componentbreaking in. Appearance is hazy.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11111968Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06228475 (Generated: 07/09/2024 23:00:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HARRY HOGAN - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454681 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 511 --- --- ---Oil Hours 511 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 49.4 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.47 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.634 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 314 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 409 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 364 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06228475 (Generated: 07/09/2024 23:00:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HARRY HOGAN - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOBELCO KOBELCO SK210 YN17010800\Hydraulic System [VCP454681] 01 Jul 2024 @ 511.0 hrs

