
[[592764 HERC]] VOLVO EC350EL 310708 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP443811
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 592764 HERC

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. Please note that there wastoo much water present in the oil toperform a viscosity test.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Sample consists almost entirely offree water. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11112496Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06229003 (Generated: 07/09/2024 14:56:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443811 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3516 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 99.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 6 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 124 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06229003 (Generated: 07/09/2024 14:56:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310708\Swing Drive [VCP443811] 01 Jul 2024 @ 3516.0 hrs

