
[[8010]] TAKEUCHI 410001658 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP434848
Oil Type: CAT DIESEL ENGINE OIL 10W30
Job No: 8010

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 11113287Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 09 Jul 2024
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06229794 (Generated: 07/09/2024 16:13:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434848 VCP351231 VCP279486 VCP281621Sample Date 25 Jun 2024 31 Mar 2022 22 Jun 2021 06 Oct 2020Machine Hours 3950 2400 1850 1335Oil Hours 0 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.4 12.8 14.6 12.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 10.6 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 112 111 116 104
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.5 0.4 0.6 0.4Nitration (PA) % 113 111 107 93Sulfation (PA) % 73 77 81 74Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 10 24 19 17Sodium ppm 4 4 4 5Potassium ppm 4 4 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 46 48 44Copper ppm 4 19 33 46Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 5 11 8 2Chromium ppm <1 3 2 2Molybdenum ppm 46 122 48 44Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2304 2013 2005 1851Magnesium ppm 570 698 584 530Zinc ppm 1439 1339 1302 1147Phosphorus ppm 1201 1107 1026 987Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 68 134 48 47

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06229794 (Generated: 07/09/2024 16:13:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI 410001658\Diesel Engine [VCP434848] 25 Jun 2024 @ 3950.0 hrs

