
[[730588 KRACKEN]] VOLVO L350H 1133 - CORE - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP447728
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 730588 KRACKEN

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 11114200Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06230707 (Generated: 07/10/2024 13:55:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447728 VCP386823 VCP315701 ---Sample Date 26 Jun 2024 15 Jun 2022 08 Sep 2021 ---Machine Hours 14441 11032 5062 ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.21 10.6 7.59 ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT 636 NT ---Percentage Glycol % 52.2 39.6 36 ---Freezing Point °C -40 -11 -8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal ---Coolant Color Orange Green Yllow ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06230707 (Generated: 07/10/2024 13:55:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L350H 1133 - CORE\Coolant [VCP447728] 26 Jun 2024 @ 14441.0 hrs

