
[[3916]] VOLVO EC480EL 315418 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP455317
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30
Job No: 3916

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: OSCAR DEL CAMPOoscar.delcampo@vcesvolvo.comT: (951)277-7620F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30.  Pleaseconfirm. Metal levels are typical for a newcomponent breaking in. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 11115572Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06232079 (Generated: 07/11/2024 09:36:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455317 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 507 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 82 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 54 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 44 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1689 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 443 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1115 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 925 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 44 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06232079 (Generated: 07/11/2024 09:36:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: OSCAR DEL CAMPO - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 315418\Diesel Engine [VCP455317] 02 Jul 2024 @ 507.0 hrs

