
[[X18785]] VOLVO L90H 626971 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP444576
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X18785

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Jackson3860 I-55 SouthJACKSON, MSUS  39212Contact: DWIGHT MCDOUGALDMCDOUGAL@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: F: (601)326-3359
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval tomonitor.Blower/turbocharger and/orpiston wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8771Unique No: 11116384Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 12 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 06232891 (Generated: 07/12/2024 12:35:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444576 VCP445374 --- ---Sample Date 24 Jun 2024 05 Mar 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 1093 548 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 12.4 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.3 9.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 80 78 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.6 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 64 59 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 60 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 9 17 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 18 --- ---Copper ppm 0 8 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 27 8 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 37 41 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 4 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1781 1652 --- ---Magnesium ppm 565 605 --- ---Zinc ppm 1227 1134 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 942 --- ---Barium ppm 0 3 --- ---Boron ppm 42 44 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 06232891 (Generated: 07/12/2024 12:35:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DWIGHT MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626971\Diesel Engine [VCP444576] 24 Jun 2024 @ 1093.0 hrs

