
[[38526]] TAKEUCHI TL10V2 412004687 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP438638
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)
Job No: 38526

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component.All metal levelsare normal indicating no corrosion inthe system. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefuel. The water content is negligible.The condition of the fuel isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 11125524Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jul 2024
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06236690 (Generated: 07/18/2024 06:57:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438638 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 188 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.003 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06236690 (Generated: 07/18/2024 06:57:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL10V2 412004687\Diesel Fuel [VCP438638] 14 Jul 2024 @ 188.0 hrs

