
[[26042]] VOLVO L90 626664 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP436669
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 26042

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 11126994Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06238160 (Generated: 07/17/2024 11:47:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436669 VCP404331 --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2024 04 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2675 1061 --- ---Oil Hours 0 1000 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.5 41.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 13 16 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 32 --- ---Copper ppm 0 0 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 14 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3753 3956 --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 17 --- ---Zinc ppm 1517 1660 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 989 1361 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 139 123 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06238160 (Generated: 07/17/2024 11:47:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90 626664\Front Axle [VCP436669] 11 Jul 2024 @ 2675.0 hrs

