
[[37592-3 HK CONTRACTO]] VOLVO L180H 5364 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP430694
Oil Type: VOLVO DEX III
Job No: 37592-3 HK CONTRACTO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: DAVE BOSTONdboston@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Tests do not reveal causefor reported problem.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 11127127Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06238293 (Generated: 07/18/2024 12:13:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430694 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3643 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 80 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 78 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 109 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 202 --- --- ---Barium ppm 5 --- --- ---Boron ppm 38 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06238293 (Generated: 07/18/2024 12:13:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BOSTON - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5364\Transmission (Auto) [VCP430694] 09 Jul 2024 @ 3643.0 hrs

