
[[730409 RENTALS]] VOLVO A25G 752678 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP439520
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 730409 RENTALS

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: N. FACEYnfacey@altaequipfl.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 11128301Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06239467 (Generated: 07/19/2024 13:18:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439520 VCP440250 --- ---Sample Date 08 Jul 2024 06 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2073 803 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 85.7 89.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 6 7 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 7 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 415 319 --- ---Copper ppm 54 45 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 2 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 6 7 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 4 --- ---Nickel ppm 5 4 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 10 11 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 806 917 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 361 391 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1351 1470 --- ---Barium ppm 4 6 --- ---Boron ppm 197 255 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06239467 (Generated: 07/19/2024 13:18:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752678\Front Axle [VCP439520] 08 Jul 2024 @ 2073.0 hrs

