
[[53897]] VOLVO G940 42422 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP453989
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 53897

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT22099 KNABE ROADCORONA, CAUS  92883Contact: KEVIN ROBINSONKEVIN.ROBINSON@VCESVOLVO.COMT: (951)258-3730F: (951)277-4550
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported issue. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fluid. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4486Unique No: 11128343Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Jul 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06239509 (Generated: 07/21/2024 12:15:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN ROBINSON - VOLVO4486

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453989 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8792 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 71 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 18 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 153 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 78 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4486 [WUSCAR] 06239509 (Generated: 07/21/2024 12:15:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN ROBINSON - VOLVO4486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G940 42422\Transmission (Auto) [VCP453989] 16 Jul 2024 @ 8792.0 hrs

